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1 Intr oduction

Elan II/IIe (North Americandesignation)is the samecameraasthe EOS50/50e(in-
ternationaldesignation).The"e" in thenamerefersto the"eye control" optionthat is
usedto quickly selectautofocuspointsaswell asdepthof field (DOF) preview. EOS,
by theway, standsfor ElectroOpticalSystem.

In writing this instructionmanualfor theCanonEOS50/50eandElanII/IIe, I have
assumedthat the userhasa basicunderstandingof lensfocal length, lensapertures,
focusing,shutterspeeds,exposure,film typeandspeeds,aswell asSLR camerasand
photographyin general. If you needinstructionswith thesebasics,you will have to
find themelsewhere.However, for themostpart,this manualwill oftengiveyoumore
adviceandinformationthanis availablein theofficial ElanII/IIe manual.

The Elan II/IIe is a 35mm, Single Lens Reflex (SLR) camera. This allows the
operatorto look throughthesamelensthat is usedfor picturetaking. It usesCanon’s
exclusiveElectroFocus(EF) bayonetlensmount.It hasnomechanicallinkagesother
thanthe mountingflangesthemselves. All communicationbetweenlensandcamera
body is doneelectronically. Several of the electricalconnectorsareusedfor power
andgroundingandothersareusedto passinformationanddatain aserialbussfashion.
ThishasallowedCanonto bringseveralupgradesto their lensesandcameraswhile still
allowing completecompatibilitywith their olderEOSequipment.It is a veryversatile
systemthatis alsobeingusedin Canon’snewerdigital SLRs.

2 CameraTop Controls

2.1 Shutter Button

TheElan II/IIe camerahasseveraldialsandbuttonsthatyou will needto familiarize
yourselfwith.

Themostimportantbuttonon thecamerais theShutter Button. It’ s in thetypical
positionon the front, right cornerof thecameranearthe top. Your right index finger
usually falls right to it asyou hold the camera. If you pressthe shutterbutton part
way down until a slightly increasedresistanceis felt, the cameracomesto life. The
camera’s usualresponseis that theexposuremeterandautofocus(AF) areactivated,
but thishalf pressis alsousedfor severalotherfunctionsaswell. Pressingit all theway
down usuallyfirestheshutterto exposethefilm, dependingon whatmodethecamera
is in.

2.2 Main Dial

On theright side,just behindtheshutterbutton is a verticaldial calledtheMain Dial
or sometimestheElectronicInput Dial. Dependingon themodethecamerais in, it is
usedto settheapertureor shutterspeedandselectdifferentfunctions.Thismaysound
confusingbut actuallyit’svery logical in practice.If youneedto makeavaluechange,
chancesaretheMain Dial doesit.
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Figure1: TopView

2.3 CommandDial

Onthetop left of thecamerayouwill find theCommandDial. It selectsthecamera’s
exposuremodesandother functions. The red L position is Lock, or the cameraoff
position. To turn the dial from the L position,pressin the metal tab on the front of
thedial. Thegreensquareis full automode. The four smallsymbolsto theright are
thePIC (ProgrammedImageControl)modes;portrait, landscape,macro,andaction.
Basically they bias the shutter/aperturecombinationsto favor longerexposuresand
smalleraperturesfor landscapeandmacromodesandtheotherwayaroundfor portrait
andactionmodes.Portrait& macromodesaswell asfull automodewill alsoraise
theflashwhenthecamerathinks it’s appropriate.Themajorrestrictionwith full auto
andPIC modesis that you cannotshift the relative valuesof theshutterandaperture
like you canin P mode. Nor canyou bias the exposureup or down like you canin
P mode. The camerapickswhat it thinks is appropriatewithout allowing any further
advicefrom you. Now thatyouknow whatthey are,ignorethem.Usingthemwill just
retardyour educationof photographyaswell aslearningaboutthecamera.Theother
positionsof theCommandDial aregenerallymoreuseful.

P is for Programmode.It setsboththeshutterspeedandtheaperture.It’snotmuch
differentthanfull autobut onething it won’t do is it won’t raisetheflashfor you. This
canbeausefulmodewhenyouneedto grabthecameraandshootwithoutmuchthink-
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Figure2: CommandDial

ing. Theprimaryadvantageof P modeover full automodeis that in P modeyou can
usetheMain Dial to shift therelativevaluesof theshutterandapertureselection.This
is calledProgramShift andit providesawayfor youto biastheexposuretowardsfaster
shutterspeedsor smallerapertureswhile thecamerainsuresaccurateexposures.You
canalsousetheQuickControlDial (QCD)onthecameraback,to biastheexposureup
(lighter images)or down (darker images)dependingon theeffect thatyou want. This
is calledAuto ExposureCompensation(AEC), andis only theambientexposurebias.
It doesnoteffect flashexposure.

Tv is for time valuemode,alsocalled"shutterpriority." You settheshutterspeed
with the Main Dial, basedon the needto freezeactionor portraysubjectmovement
or simply for handhold ability. The camerathenselectsan appropriateaperturefor
correctexposure.While in Tv modeyoucanalsousetheQCDto changetheexposure
up or down (AEC). This is only ambientexposurebiasandit doesnot effect theflash
exposure.

Any shutterspeedcan be set between1/4000secondto 30 seconds.Below 30
secondstheshuttergoesinto Bulb modewhereit will stayopenaslong asyou hold
theshutterbuttondown or until thebatterygoesflat. Theremotecontroller, RC-1and
theremoteswitch,RS-60E3bothhave methodsto manuallyhold theshutteropenas
longasyou like.

Av is for aperturevaluemode,alsocalled"aperturepriority." Youselecttheaperture
with theMain Dial, basedon theneedto limit or expanddepthof field/focus,andthe
cameraselectsa shutterspeedto provide the properexposure.Av modecanalsobe
usedwhenyouwantto selectthefastestshutterspeedpossibleandstill maintainproper
exposurein changinglight. To do that you just setthe apertureto the largestsetting
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(smallestnumber)and the camerawill automaticallyselectthe fastestshutterspeed
settingthat will still provide the correctexposure. While in Av mode,you canalso
usetheQCD to change/biastheexposureup or down (AEC). This is only theambient
exposurebiasandit doesnoteffect theflashexposure.

In P, Av or Tv modes,a blinking apertureor shutterindicatormaymeanthat it is
out of its availablerange. So if your apertureis blinking f/5.6 andthat is the lens’s
largestaperture,you will have to selecta slower shutterspeedto bring the required
aperturein line with your lens’savailableaperture.Also if 4000is blinking, thenusea
smallerapertureto bringtherequiredshutterspeeddown to whatthecamerais capable
of doing.

Theshutterspeedalsoblinksasashakewarningif theshutterspeedfallsmorethan
1/2stopbelow thereciprocalof thelenslength.

M is for manualexposuremode. You selecttheaperturewith theMain Dial and
shutterspeedwith the QCD. The camera’s built-in light meterwill still function in
manualmodeandyou canfollow its leador ignoreit completely. Themeter’sdisplay
canbeseenboth in theviewfinderaswell ason the top mountedLiquid CrystalDis-
play (LCD) on the top right sideof thecamera.A properexposure,accordingto the
camera’s meter, is whenthemeterindicatoris centeredon thescale.Themeterscale
coversa four stoprange. Eachhashmark represents1/2 stopof exposuredeviation.
A negative indicationshows with underexposureanda positive indicationshows with
overexposure.

DEP is for depthof field autoexposuremode. It allows thecamerato decidethe
appropriateapertureandfocuspositionto provide enoughdepthof field to keeptwo
selecteddistancessharplyin focus. Theeasiestway to useit is to turn theCommand
Dial to DEP, andusethecenterautofocussensor, point thecameraat thefirst subject
andpresstheshutterbuttonhalf way to autofocus.Let thebuttonupandthenpoint the
sameAF sensoron thetop of thesecondsubjectandpresstheshutterhalf way again
to allow the lensto autofocuson the secondsubject. Thenreframeyour cameraand
takethepicture.Thecamerawill selecta focusdistancebetweenthesubjectdistances,
thenselectanaperturesmall enoughto keepboth subjectsin focusandthenselecta
shutterspeedthatwill provideproperexposure.If youselectthesamesubjectdistance
twice, thecamerawill selectthewidestapertureavailableto keepdepthof field very
shallow. Thelensmustbesetto AF for DEPmodeto work andif youareusingazoom
lens,you mustnot changeits zoomsettingduring theentireprocedure.You canalso
manuallyor eyecontrolselectthesideAF sensors,but I think it just addsconfusion.

A blinkingapertureindicatedthatsufficientdepthof field (DOF)cannotbeachieved.
Youmustfocusonsubjectsthatarecloserto thesamedistanceapartor useawideran-
gle lens.Flashcannotbeusedwith DEPmode

CF (CustomFunction)is discussedbelow
CAL (Elan IIe only) is usedfor calibratingthe Eye Control Focus(ECF) of the

Elan IIe to the shapeandsize of your eye. Turn the CommandDial to CAL, look
directly at the blinking AF point, pressandhold the shutterbutton until the camera
beeps.Thenlook directly at the next blinking AF point andhold the shutterbutton
until thecamerabeeps.Turn thecamerato theverticalpositionandpressandrelease
the shutterbriefly. Then look directly at the blinking AF point, pressandhold the
shutterbuttonuntil thecamerabeeps.Thenlook directlyat thenext blinking AF point
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andhold the shutterbutton until the camerabeeps.You’re all done,but you should
do this repeatedlyin differentkinds of lighting. The moreyou recalibrate,the more
accurateECFwill become.

Therearethreedifferentcalibrationsettingsthat canbeusedfor differentpeople
or for whenyou wearglasses,contacts,etc. You canchangethecalibrationsettingby
turning the CommandDial to CAL andthenturning the Main Dial. You canseethe
selection(1, 2 or 3) in boththeviewfinderandtheLCD onthetopof thecamera.

You canerasea calibrationsettingby selectingit andthenholding the two small
thumbbuttonsontheupperright of thecameraback,until thesettingblinksin theLCD
screenon the top of thecamera.You shouldalwayserasea calibrationsettingif it is
to beusedby anotherphotographer. Thenrecalibrateto their eye. Otherwisesomeone
else’spreviouscalibrationswill continueto effect their new ones.

2.4 Metering Mode

Justbelow, andon thesameswitchstemastheCommandDial is theMetering mode
switch. Thefront (blanksquare)positionsetsthecamerato centerweightedmetering.
If you arevery usedto meteringpatternsof older manualcamerasandautomatically
correctfor theirmeteringerrorsin difficult situations,youmight feelmorecomfortable
with this position.Themiddlepositionsetsthecamerato 9.5%partialareametering.
This is basicallya fat spot meter. The areait metersis a bit larger than the bright
circular areasurroundingthe centerAF point. By settingcustomfunction #8 to "1",
thepartialmeteringareawill move to theareasurroundingtheactive AF point if that
point is selectedmanuallyor by eye control, otherwiseit staysin the center. The
rearposition(squarewith circle in it) of themeteringmodeswitchsetsthecamerato
evaluative meteringmode. This dividesthepictureareaup into severalareas,meters
themindependentlyandthencomparesthatto adatabaseof possibleimagesthatwould
createsucha patternof light & darkareas.Thecamera’s computerthendecideswhat
exposureto use. This modeworks quite well andprovidesthe highestpercentageof
accurateexposureswith the leastamountof effort, but its down side is, you never
really know how muchit is biasingthe exposuretowardsthe dark or light areas. If
youknow whatyou’redoing,in difficult lighting, suchasabacklit portraitor anarctic
fox in thesnow, you would bebetteroff usingthepartialmeterandmakingyour own
compensations.You’ll alsolearnmorethis way.

2.5 SelfTimer / RemoteControl

Justto thefront andleft of theCommandDial is theSelf Timer buttonthatalsoacti-
vatesthe IR remoteswitch. Pressthis buttonandtheSelf Timer indicatorappearsin
the LCD. If you pressthe shutter, you will have 10 secondsbeforethe shutterfires.
This shouldgive you time to get into the pictureyourself. The red light on the front
of thecamerawill blink every secondandspeedup for the last two secondsbeforeit
fires. Thebeeperwill alsosoundduring this time if you don’t have thebeeperturned
off. With customfunction#5 setto "1", theself timer is reducedto a 2 seconddelay
with themirror raisingassoonasyou presstheshutter. This is usedprimarily to re-
ducecameravibrationscausedby themirror movement.Its mainpurposeis in extreme
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macroandtelephotouse. You cancancelthe Self Timer during this 2 or 10 second
wait, beforetheshutterfiresby pressingtheSelf Timerbuttonagain.

The RC-1 IR remotecontrol is relatively inexpensive andworks very well for
numeroussituations. You canuseit insteadof the Self Timer whenyou want to be
in thepicture,or whenyou want to trip the shutterwithout touchingthe camerathat
would causevibration. It alsohasa threepositionswitch,off, on and2 seconddelay.
The 2 seconddelaypositionis for whenyou arein the pictureandwant to hide the
remotebeforetheexposure.

2.6 FocusMode Switch

On theothersideof theprism/flashhumpyou’ll find theFocusmodeswitchandthe
Film Advanceswitch.TheFocusmodeswitchis on topandhasthreepositionsandof
course,only workswhenthelensis setto AF modeitself. In OneShotmode,assoon
asyoupresstheshutterbuttonhalf waydown, thecamerawill autofocusandlock onto
onasubjectandit stayslockedat thisdistanceaslongasyoucontinuehold theshutter
buttonhalf waydown. In thismodethefocushasto lock ontosomedistancebeforethe
shutterwill fire. This canpreventout of focuspicturesaslong asthesubjectdoesn’t
movetowardsor away from thecamera.

Figure3: FocusModeSwitch

In AI Servo modethecamerawill focuson thesubjectbut will not lock anything.
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If thesubjectmovesthefocusfollows.
Sometimesyouwantto focusonaparticulardistanceandthenrecomposewith your

subjectoff center. You cando this by selectinga sideAF point, or by autofocusing
in OneShotmodeandholding the shutterbutton half way down to keepthat focus
distanceselected. You can’t do this in AI Servo mode,but then you can’t track a
moving object in One Shot mode. They both have their advantages.Most people
preferto keepthecamerain OneShotmodeandchangingit whenthey needto.

Thereis a middleposition,theAI Focusmodethat is thesameasOneShotmode
until the cameradetectsthat the subjecthasmoved closeror fartheraway. Then it
automaticallyshifts into AI Servo mode. This is a goodcompromise,but thereare
timeswhenit will shift into AI Servo modewhenyou don’t want it to andthenthere
areothertimeswhenyou wantit to but it doesn’t reactfastenough.

2.7 Film AdvanceSwitch

TheFilm Advanceswitch is right undertheFocusmodeswitch. It hastwo positions.
Single Shot modeis the usualposition and it will take one picture at a time. You
have to raiseyour finger off the shutterbutton completelyandthenpressit againto
take anotherpicture. In ContinuousAdvancemodethe camerawill continueto take
picturesat 2.5 framesper secondaslong asyou keepyour finger presseddown and
thereis still film to burn. In ContinuousAdvancemode,andif youarealsoin AI Servo
focusmode,therewill bea slight delaybetweenframesasthecameralooks to seeif
it is still in focusandthenreadjustsasnecessary. However if you werein Continuous
AdvancemodeandOneShotfocusmodethecamerawould lock ontoa distanceand
keepit therethroughoutits continuousshootingspree.

2.8 Built In Flash

Justin front of the FocusMode switch thereis a button that whenpressedwill raise
thebuilt-in flash. To get theflashto go backdown you just pushit down. Thebuilt-
in flashis fairly weakandit’s alsocloseenoughto the lensto causeredeye in many
situations.Its primarybenefitis whenyou have to have flashanddidn’t bring alonga
realonewith you,andalsowhenyouneedfill flashoutdoors.As longasyourdistance
isn’t toogreatandyourapertureisn’t toosmall,it will work.

2.9 CustomFunctions

CF modeis usedto settheelevenavailableCustomFunctions.Theseareusedto cus-
tomizethecamerato your particularshootingstyleandto changetheway thecamera
works for a particularsituation. To usethem,turn the CommandDial to the CF po-
sition, turn the Main Dial to selectthe customfunction you want andthenpressthe
"*-cf" buttonto changeits value.

CustomFunctionsonly work in thenon-PICmodes.
Thecustomfunctionsare:
1) Rewind Speed0 = quiet,1 = fast
2) Film leader0 = rewind it in, 1 = leave it out
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3) Auto DX film speedsetting0 = on,1 = off
4) Useof * button
0 = AF startwith shutterbutton,exposurelock with "*" button
1 = AF startwith "*" button,exposurelock with shutterbutton
2 = sameas0, plusDOFcheckwith "*" button
5) Mirror lock with self timer
0 = normaltensecondself timer,
1 = mirror locksupandtheself timerbecomestwo seconds
6) Secondcurtainflashsync0 = off, 1) = on
7) AF assistbeam0 = off, 1) = on
8) Spot& FEL to focuspoint
0 = Partialmeter& FlashExposureLock at centerpoint only
1 = PartialmeterandFEL follow theactiveAF sensor
9) Force1/125syncin AV mode
0 = In Av modewith flashprovidesfull ambientexposure
1 = In Av modetheshutteris lockedat1/125second
10) AF indicatorlights 0 = off, 1) = on
11) EyecontrolDOFpreview 0 = off, 1) = on (ElanIIe only)

3 Other CameraControls & Features

3.1 Auto Exposure Lock Button

Justbehindthe top mountedLCD aretwo thumbbuttons. The oneon the left is the
AE Lock button. It’s markedwith a "*-cf" symbol. The"cf" partof thesymbolis to
denotethatit is usedto setthevaluesof thecustomfunctions,explainedabove. When
thecamerais not setto theCF modeon theCommandDial, theAE Lock buttoncan
do several things. Its primary purposeis to set the exposurefor onesceneandthen
recomposethepicture. This worksparticularlywell with partial meteringwhereyou
wantto metera subjectbut composethescenewith thesubjectoff center.

Normallypressingtheshutterbuttonhalf wayactivatesautofocus,andpressingthe
AE Lock buttonlockstheexposurevaluethat is determinedby thecamera’s metering
system.This is calledAuto ExposureLock (AEL). However, if customfunction#4 is
setto "1" thefunctionsarereversed.Theprimaryreasonyoumightwantthisis to move
yourautofocusaway from theshutterbutton.Thatway youwould only reactivateAF
when you wantedto, not every time you pressthe shutter. If you couplethis with
Canon’sUSM lensesthatallow Full TimeManualfocusing(FTM), youcanautofocus
by thepushof the"*" button,andmanuallyfocusby turningthefocusring onthelens,
all without switchingthe AF/MF switch on the lens. This may not soundlike a big
deal,but for many photographersthis is theprimaryreasonto buy Canonequipment.
Thelow endline of CanonlensesuseamicromotorUSM thatdoesnotallow FTM, so
payattentionto whatyou’reputtingyourmoney down for. USM standsfor UltraSonic
Motor. They arenearlysilentandthemid andupscaleonesarefast!

Nikon hasrecentlystartedsellinga few SilentWave lensesthatareessentiallythe
samething asUSM. Only someof thehigh-endlenseshave this "S" designationand
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Figure4: BackView

they only work with thelatestNikon Camerabodies,but thecompetitionon this front
is heatingup. Also Sigmahassomesimilar HSM lensesthataremadein bothCanon
andNikonmounts.

3.2 Auto FocusPoint SelectionButton

Theotherthumbbuttonbackhereis theAF Point Selectionbutton. You pressit and
then usethe Main Dial to selectthe particularAF point you want, or to selecteye
controlAF. Or you canselectall theAF points,which will thenallow thecamerato
automaticallyselecttheAF point it thinksyouprobablywantfor thescene,usuallythe
closestsubjectwith sufficientcontrast.Whenyou haveselectedwhatyou want,either
presstheAF PointSelectionbuttonagainor presstheshutterbuttonhalf way down to
confirmyourselection.

3.3 Quick Control Dial

The largedial on thecamerabackis the Quick Control Dial (QCD). Most previous
EOScamerasdid nothaveaQCD.ThatforcedtheMain Dial to dotoomany functions
dependingon whatbuttonyou hadpushed.TheQCD allows you to biastheexposure
while in P, Av or Tv modesandin Manualmodeit setstheaperturewhile theshutter
is controlledby theMain Dial. Thereis alsoanon/off switch, aboveandto theleft of
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theQCD. This simply activatestheQCD whenin the "1" position. I usuallyleave it
on. Otherscomplainthatthedial getsmovedaccidentally, sothey keepit turnedoff.

3.4 Function Button

On thecamerabackneartheleft sideis theFunction button. Repeatedpressesof the
buttoncycle you throughseveraldifferentoptions. Thereis no fixedstartingpoint in
this cycle so the first pressmay be anywherein the cycle of options. I’ ll startwith
the ISO selector. Pressthe Functionbutton repeatedlyuntil you get there,andthen
turn theMain Dial until you getthefilm speedyou want. Presstheshutterbuttonhalf
way to confirm your selection. Unlessyou have customfunction #3 set to "1", this
EI (ExposureIndex) or "rated"ISO will only apply to theroll of film you have in the
camera. As soonasyou put anotherfilm canisterinto the camerait will selectthe
film speedthat is imbeddedinto theDX coding. Obviously customfunction#3 is for
whenyouwantto "rate"afilm andhaveseveralrolls of it youwantto burn right away.
Weddingphotographersfrequentlydo thiswith someprofessionalfilms.

Anotherpressof theFunctionbuttonwill get you to Auto Exposure Bracketing
(AEB). By turningtheMain Dial you will seethesingleexposurepoint, on theexpo-
surescale,in theLCD, turn into threepoints.As you turn thedial furthertheexposure
pointswill separatemore.Eachclick of thedial separatestheexposurepointsanaddi-
tional 1/2 exposurestopaway from eachother. If you wantAEB to bethreeseparate
exposures,1 stopapart,set the scaleso the outsidepointsareat -1 and+1 with the
centerpoint in thecenterof theexposuregraph.Presstheshutterhalf way to confirm
your selection.The next threeshotswill be; 1) at the selectedexposure,2) onestop
underexposed,andthen3) onestopoverexposed.Youcando thissamethingwithout
AEB by usingAuto ExposureCompensationfor eachexposure,but AEB providesan
easyway to do this for severaldifferentshotsin a row. Maybeeventhewholeroll. If
youwantmoreor lessthana3 shotAEB, youwouldhaveto doit with AEC or justuse
Manualmode.

The next pressof the Functionbutton bringsthe camerato Red Eye Reduction
mode. UsetheMain Dial to select"0" for off, or "1" for on. Presstheshutterbutton
half waydown to confirmyourselection.Thisonly workswith thebuilt-in flashin the
up position. You probablywon’t needit with anexternalflashasit sits fartheraway
from thelensaxis.Thismodeprovidesyouwith severalsecondsof abrightwhite light
to helpreducetheiris of thesubjectseyes.Justpresstheshutterbuttonhalf way down
for threesecondsandthentake thepicture. This will annoy your subjectsto no end,
andin my opinion this is a nearlyworthlessfeature,but othercamerashave them,so
Canonhadto do it too.

The next pressof theFunctionbuttonbringsthecamerato thebeepcontrol fea-
tur e. Usethe Main Dial to select"0" for off, or "1" for on. Pressthe shutterbutton
half waydown to confirmyourselection.I don’t normallylikecamerasbeepingatme,
but I leave thisoneonbecauseit confirmswhenthefocushaslockedon,andit’squiet
enoughnot to bea realbother.

The next pressof the Functionbutton bringsthe camerato the Multi-Exposur e
mode.UsetheMain Dial to selectthenumberof exposuresyouwill wantonthisframe
of film. Nine is themaximum.Presstheshutterbuttonhalf waydown to confirmyour
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selection.Theexposurecounterin theLCD will now displaytheremainingexposures
to be takenon this frameinsteadof theusualframenumber. If you decideyou don’t
wantto useall theMultiple Exposuresyouselected,simplypresstheMF buttonagain
andthenturn theMain Dial until thenumbersremainingdisappear. Presstheshutter
buttonhalf way to confirm this selection.Gettingmorethan9 exposureson a single
frameis alsopossible;beforeyou getto thelastexposurefor this frame,presstheMF
buttonuntil you getbackto theMulti-Exposuremodeandturn theMain Dial to add
moreexposures.Presstheshutterbuttonhalf way to confirmthis selection.

The next pressof the Functionbutton bringsthe camerato the Flash Exposure
Compensation(FEC)feature.This worksfor boththebuilt-in flashandany attached
dedicatedflashunits. UsetheMain Dial to select+ or - FEC.Presstheshutterbutton
half way down to confirm your selection.With CanonEOScameras,flashexposure
is totally separatefrom theregularambientexposure.Applying theregularAuto Ex-
posureCompensationwill not effect theflashexposure,andusingFECwill not effect
AEC. Therearemany timesyou would want to adjustoneor the otherbut not both,
howeverresettingthefilm ISOwill effectboth.Oftenusing-0.5to -1.0FECis desired
for additionalfill flashreduction.Keepin mind thatCanonalreadyappliesup to -1.5
stopsof autofill flashreductiondependingon light levels.

3.5 Film Rewind Button

Justbelow theFunctionbuttonis theFilm Rewind button.Youcanusethis to rewind
thefilm early. It will alsoincreasethespeedof therewind by pressingit again.Nor-
mally theElanII/IIe autorewindswhenit comesto theendof a roll. It doesthis in the
silentrewind mode.You canspeedthis up by pressingtherewind buttonafter it starts
to autorewind.

The Elan II/IIe usesan Infrar ed (IR) frame counter that allows you to remove
a roll of partially usedfilm by pressingthe rewind button, andwith customfunction
#2 setto "1" the film leaderwill be left out. You canthenmark on the canisterhow
many frameshavebeenused.Whenyoureloadit into thecamerato usetheremaining
unusedframes,settheCommandDial to M, theshutterat 1/4000,put thelenscapon,
setthefocusswitchonthelensto MF, andfire theshutteruntil yougetbackto thesame
framenumberyouhadwhenyouremovedthefilm. Thereis noneedto wasteanextra
frameto guaranteethatyouwon’t overlapthelastexposure.TheIR framecounterwill
placeyoubackto thesameexactpositionevery time without frameoverlap.

3.6 Film Window

Thedarklittle Film Window ontheleft sideof thecamerabackallowsyouto seewhat
typeandspeedof film you have loaded.

3.7 CameraBack Release

On theleft sideis theCamera Back Release. Canonmadetwo backsfor thecamera,
onewith a datefeatureandonewithout, but they arenot interchangeable.With the
backopenyou canseewherethe film is to be loaded. Put the film canisterinto the
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spaceon theleft sideandpull thefilm leaderoutuntil it linesupwith theorangemark
on theright sideof theopencamera,andclosetheback. If thecamerais not already
on,turn it onnow, andthefilm will wind to thefirst frame.Can’t getmucheasierwith
35mmfilm.

Figure5: InsideView

YoucanseetheIR framecounternearthetopof thefilm rail ontheright side.This
might fog someinfraredtypefilms, but mostIR film usersreportthatit is actuallynot
aproblemin spiteof Canon’scautionsagainstusingIR films with theElanII/IIe.

3.8 LensReleaseButton

To the left of the lensmountis theLens Releasebutton. Pushit in andturn the lens
counterclockwiseto removeit.

3.9 Auto FocusAssistLight

Also on the front of the camerais the red AutofocusAssist Light . It emitsa pat-
ternednearinfraredlight thatwill allow thecamerato autofocusin otherwisecomplete
darkness.This light comeson automaticallyandvery briefly whenthecamerais aut-
ofocusingin low light situations.It’s rangeis up to 21 feetfor centerAF point and13
feetfor sideAF points.This will dependon thelensbeingused.If you haveanexter-
nal Speedliteflashunit attachedthecamerawill usuallyusetheAF assistlight in the
externalflashinsteadof theonebuilt into thecamerabody. This will save thecamera
batterypower andtheexternallights areusuallymorepowerful. Someexternalflash
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Figure6: FrontView

unitsdo not cover thesideAF pointshowever, sowith thoseflashes,thecamerawill
useit’s own AF assistlight whena sideAF point is selected.Whenusingsomelarge
diameterlensesthe left sideAF assistlight may be blocked by the lensbarrel. The
darkredcircle thathousestheAF assistlight, closeto theshutterbutton,alsohouses
thereceiver for theoptionalIR remotecontrol,RC-1.

3.10 RemoteReleasePort

On the left sideof the camerais a small hole that is actuallythe plug in port for the
RS-60E3Cord Remote. Justplug it in andyoucantrip yourshutterwithout touching
yourcamera.Thismakesfor muchsteadiershotswhenusinga tripod.

3.11 Battery Compartment

TheBatteryCompartmentis onthebottom,ontheright side.It usesa2CR-5lithium 6
Volt battery. Canonclaimsthatyou canexpectup to 90 rolls of 24 exposurefilm with
onebattery. Cold weatheranduseof the internalflashwill reducethat considerably.
Below zero(F) tempsandusingflashon all exposureswill reducethis to aslittle as6
rolls of film.
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4 LCD and Viewfinder Inf ormation

4.1 Liquid Crystal Display

The liquid crystal display (LCD) on the top right sideof thecamera,shows quitea
bit of informationaboutwhatis goingonwith thecamera.At thetop left is a numeric
displaythatshows theshutterspeedwhenmetering,but is alsousedto show thefilm
speed,customfunction numberandeye calibrationnumber. At the top right is the
aperturedisplaythat is alsousedto show AEB amount,andcustomfunction option,
red eye, andbeepersettingnumbers.The next row down hasthe ECF on indicator,
ISO,AEB andredeye reductiononsymbols.

Figure7: LCD Panel

Thethird row down hasthebatteryindicatorthatshowshow muchbatterypoweris
left. It usuallyshowsfull until shortlybeforethebatterystartsto die. A flashingbattery
indicator, or no batteryindicatorat all, usuallymeansthebatteryis dead.A flashing
batteryindicatorcanalsomeanthat the camerahaslockedup for somereason.The
usualsolutionsare; take thebatteryout, try a new battery, cleanthebatterycontacts,
cleanthelensandlensmountcontacts,removethelens,removetheexternalflashunit.
If it still blinks,you’vegota problem.

To theright of thebatteryindicatoris themultiple exposureindicator. Whenthis
is lit you shouldalsoseethe framecounterportion of the LCD showing how many
multiple exposuresareleft beforethecameraadvancesthefilm. Moving furtherto the
right is the beeperon indicatorandthena CF indicating that a customfunction has
beenturnedon.

Thefourth row hastheFlashExposureCompensationindicatorthatshows when-
evertheFECis somethingotherthan0. To theright is theself timer / remoteactivation
indicator. Justbelow it is theMF (ManualFocus)indicatorthat shows up whenever
you turn the autofocusswitch on your lensto MF. To the far right is the film frame
counter, that is alsousedto displaythenumberof multiple exposuresleft to be taken
beforethefilm advancesandit alsocountsdown theself-timer. Thebottomof theLCD
showsa film canisterif film is loadedandblinks if it is rewound.
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To the right is the exposuregraph. Most of the time the indicator is underthe 0
mark,but if youhavesetAuto ExposureCompensation(AEC) theindicatorwill move
to the - or the + sideto show how muchcompensationyou areusing. It hasa +/- 2
stoprange.Thisgraphis alsousedto show Auto ExposureBracketing(AEB). As you
setAEB you will seethesingleindicatorbecomethreeindicatorsshowing how much
AEB you have selected.You will alsoseea numericindicationof theAEB amountin
theupperright handof thedisplay. YoucancombineAEB with AEC, but youarestill
limited to the2 stopmaximumrange.

The graphalsois usedasa shortcountdown indicator for the red eye reduction
lamp.

Theexposuregraphis alsousedwhenmeteringin manualmode.Settingtheindica-
tor to 0 is whatthecamera’smeterrecommends.Of courseoneof theprimereasonsfor
usingmanualmodeis disregardwhatthemetersays,but it still givesyouanindication
of how faryou arefrom therecommendedexposure.

4.2 Viewfinder Display

Theviewfinder alsoshows muchof thesameinformationastheLCD sothatyou can
seenecessarydatawithoutremovingyoureyefrom theviewfinder. Thescreenis called
aNew LaserMattescreenandit is fairly bright,but it is accusedof sacrificingcontrast
for brightness.This would be bad, if true, in a manualfocuscamerabut isn’t much
to complainaboutwith autofocus.You canseethreeautofocussquaresthat light up
asthey comeinto focus, indicatingwhich AF point is active. The actualAF areais
slightly larger thanthe small squaresshow but accuratelyindicatethe spot. Thereis
alsoanAF indicatordot in theline of lights below thescreen.TheseAF squareswill
alsolight upwhenyoumanuallyfocusyourEF(EOS)mountlens.But if youareusing
amanualfocuslenswith a lensadapterthey will notwork.

ThecentralAF point is a crosstypesensorandis sensitive to contrastinglines in
any direction.TheouterAF pointsarelinearandaresensitiveto horizontalcontrasting
lines. They won’t work if theonly linesarecompletelyvertical. In practicethis isn’t
muchof a issueandyoucanalwaystip thecameraa bit for verticallinedsubjects.

Also on the screenis a small squarein the upperleft. This is what you look at
to activate the DOF preview whenusingeye control on the Elan IIe. To useit you
have to have thecamerain OneShotfocusmode,lock the focuson somethingusing
eye control to selectthe AF point, then look at the little square.The lenswill then
stopdown to thetakingapertureandyou will seethescreengetdarker andthedepth
of field getdeeper. Of courseyou have to have selectedanaperturesmallerthanthe
lensesmaximumfor this to doanything.

Whenyou pressthe shutterbutton half way down the meteris activatedandthe
viewfinderdatadisplayis lit up. At thebottomof theview screen,startingon theleft,
thereis aneye control indicator. Next to it is the* of theAuto ExposureLock (AEL)
indicator, followedby a flashreadyindicatorthatis alsousedto indicateinvalid Flash
ExposureLock (FEL) warning.Thenumericdisplayis for theshutterspeed,eyecon-
trol calibration,andFEL lock indication.Thenext numericdisplayis for theaperture
value. Followedby theFlashExposureCompensation(FEC) indicator. Thenthereis
the exposuregraphlike the oneon the LCD andis usedfor thesamepurposes.The
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farthestright, bottomindicatoris adot to show thatthecamerahasfoundsomethingto
focuson.

5 Flash

5.1 Built In Flash

The Elan II/IIe’ s Built In Flash is TTL only. Like all suchbuilt in flashunits, it is
limited by its low power. It is also very closeto the lens axis, and this frequently
causesthedreadedredeyeeffect in yourpictures,which is really just theflashlighting
up thebacksideof thesubject’s eyeball. Moving theflashfartherabove your lensis
the bestsolution. This will alsocauseany shadows on the wall behindyour subject
to fall below the imageof your subjectwhereit will eithernot be seenor not be as
objectionable.

Thebuilt in flashunit alsohousesabrightwhitelight thatactsasaredeyereduction
lamp.With theflashupandredeyeenabled,pressandhold theshutterbuttonuntil the
graphindicatorat thebottomof theviewfinder(aswell astheonein theLCD) centers
itself. Thentake thepicture.Whathappensis thebright light shinesin theeyesof the
subjectandcausesthe iris of theeye to contract,reducingthered reflectionfrom the
backof theeye. Most peoplefind this totally annoying, sonow thatyou know how to
do it, turn thething off! Therearebetterwaysof dealingwith redeye. Includingred
eyeremoval pensfor yourprints.

Whenusingsomelarger lensesthe built in flashmay be partially blockedby the
lensbarrel.Thiswill causearoundedshadow at thebottomof thepicture.This is most
pronouncedat wide zoomsettingsandclosedistances.Thecureis to useanexternal
flashsinceit is mountedhigherabovethelens.

5.2 FlashMetering

The Elan II/IIe is capableof ThroughThe Lens(TTL) andAdvancedTTL (A-TTL)
flashmeteringwith externalCanonE andEZ seriesSpeedlites.It is alsocapableof
EvaluativeTTL (E-TTL) flashmeteringwith externalCanonEX seriesSpeedlites.For
severalreasons,E-TTL is generallythepreferredmeteringmethod.

With TTL and A-TTL , thecamera’sbuilt-in flashmetersensesthelight Through
TheLens(TTL) andreflectedOff TheFilm (OTF). Whenenoughlight hasreachedthe
film thecamerasignalstheflashto stopit’sflashpulse.Thisall takesplacein lessthan
1/1000second.On theElan II/IIe this exposureis meteredby a four area,threezone
flashmeterandmeteringis biasedtowardthegeneralareaof whateverautofocuspoint
is activeat thetime.

With E-TTL mode, the flash exposurecontrol is determinedbeforethe shutter
opensby meansof apre-flashthatis meteredby thesamemeterasthecamera’sregular,
ambientlight, evaluative meter. This pre-flashoccursabout1/20 secondbeforethe
mainflashandyou canusuallyseeit in theviewfinderjust beforeit blacksout for the
exposure.This systemcomparestheambientlight readingwith theflashreadingand
adjustsboththeambientexposureandflashexposureto, hopefully, providetheoptimal
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exposure.E-TTL alsobiasestheflashexposuretowardstheareasurroundingtheactive
AF point.

E-TTL usuallyworksbetterthanTTL andA-TTL whenthelighting is difficult such
asabacklitor smallnearbysubjectwith adistantbackground,or anoff-centersubject.
E-TTL is alsoanimprovementwith daylightfill flash,providing amorenaturallook.

5.3 E-TTL Features

Canon’sE-TTL systemallowsthepre-flashto befiredupto 16secondsbeforethemain
flash,so you canhave FlashExposureLock (FEL) by pressingthe AE Lock button.
Thisallowsyouto point thecameraat thesubject,determineandsettheflashexposure
for the subject,and then recomposeto shoot. It is very similar to Auto Exposure
Lock (AEL) but for theflashexposure.FEL normallybiasestheexposureto thearea
surroundingthecentralAF, but if customfunction#8 is setto "1" theflashis biasedto
theactiveAF point if theAF point is eithermanuallychosenor selectedby eyecontrol.

E-TTL alsoprovidesamethodof meteredhigh speedsync(FPFlash)to allow you
to useanEX seriesSpeedliteat a shutterspeedfasterthanthenormaltop syncspeed
of thecamera(1/125sec.) This will allow you to usefasterfilm andwider apertures
whenusingdaylight fill flash. Canon’s FP Flashmodeworks in E-TTL modeso it
automaticallycalculatesflashexposures.

Wir elessE-TTL Flashcanalsobedonewith someCanonSpeedlites.Youneeda
mastermountedoncamera(or attachedto anOff CameraShoeCord2) andat leastone
slave. The550EXworksbestasamasterandyouuseeithera420EXor another550EX
astheslave. Thewirelessmodeonly works in E-TTL or wirelessmanualmodes,and
only with theSpeedlitesthathave this featurebuilt in. At thetime of this writing, this
limits you to the420EX,550EX,or oneof Canon’s two E-TTL ring flashes.TheST-
E2 hasno flashbuilt in, but canbeusedastheshoemountedmasterinsteadof using
anotherflashfor this. TheSigmaEF-500Superis a third party550EXcloneandcan
alsobeusedaseithera slaveor a master.

SecondCurtain Syncwith customfunction#6 setto "1", is a featurethateffects
flashexposureswith relatively long shutterspeeds.Its primarypurposeis to get light
trails to follow the flashinsteadof leadingit. In normalsyncmodethe flashfires at
the beginning of the exposure. If the exposureis long andthe subjectmoves,some
of that movementmight be recordedon film, andit will look like it’s in front of the
flashexposure.Sceneslike moving carswith headlightson will appearto bemoving
backwards.Settingthesyncto thesecondcurtainmakesthetrailing movementappear
behindthe subject. Secondcurtainsynccanusuallybe left on without any negative
resultsandit workswith thebuilt-in flash.Therewill bea multi headedarrow symbol
thatshowsontheLCD of anexternalSpeedlitewhensecondcurtainsyncis on. Second
CurtainSyncworkswith all of Canon’sE, EZ andEX seriesSpeedlites.

5.4 FlashExposure Modes

In low light with thecamerain P, Full Auto, and PIC modesthecamerawill usually
selecta wide aperture. Also the shutterspeedwill be held to no slower than 1/60
second,but aslight levelsincreasetheshutterspeedwill riseto beequalto thecamera’s
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highestsync speed(1/125 sec.). Also as light levels increase,to the point of over
exposureby thebrighterambientlight, thelensaperturewill getincreasinglysmaller.

With thecamerain Av, Tv and M modes,thecamerameterwill insistonafull and
properambientlight exposurein additionto yourflashexposure.It’s thesamethingas
night flashmodein someothercameras.Thebackgroundwill beproperlyexposedby
theambientlight exposureandtheflashwill insurethat thesubjectin theforeground
is properlyexposedby theflash.However, if thelight is dim, theshutterspeedwill get
veryslow, oftentooslow to handhold thecamera.If thathappensyoucansimply turn
the camerabackto P modewhich will raisethe shutterto 1/60 second,but this will
usuallycreatedark,underexposedbackgrounds.A slow shutterspeedwith thecamera
mountedonatripodis oftenthebestsolution.Also, theElanII/IIe hascustomfunction
# 9 to keeptheshutterspeedat 1/125sec.in Av modeif you wantthat.

I find thatwhenusingflash,settingthecamerato manualmodeis usuallyeasierto
keepeverythingin control.Sincetheflashexposureis beingdeterminedautomatically
anyway, having the cameraon manualreally doesn’t slow much of anything down.
Also, remember, that with flash the apertureeffectsboth ambientlighting andflash
lighting, but theshutterspeedonly effectsambientlighting. This is becausetheflash
pulseis muchfasterthantheshutter.

5.5 Auto Fill FlashReduction

TheElan II/IIe automaticallyprovidesnegative FlashExposureCompensation(FEC)
whenshootingin bright light. If usingflashwith light levels above 10EV (equalto
f/5.6 @ 1/30seconds)thecameraassumesyou wanta normalambientlight exposure
with fill flash to brightenthe nearbysubject,so it reducesthe normal flash output.
This effect fadesin as the brightnessof the ambientlighting increasesabove EV10.
The maximumof -1.5 stopsof FEC is appliedwith TTL/A-TTL meteringandup to
2 stopswith E-TTL. This autoFEC happensin all cameramodesandis designedto
makeyourfill flashpicturesmorenaturallooking. Mostpeopleliketheeffectbut many
photographerswantevenmorereductionfor their fill flashpictures.Thiscanbeeasily
donewith theElanII/IIE by meansof theFECcontrolon thecamerabody. This FEC
will bein additionto any autoFECthecameradecideson. SomeEOScamerashavea
customfunctionto eliminatethis Auto Fill Flash Reduction, but theElanII/IIe does
not.

5.6 Other Flash Options

OtherFlashOptions: The Elan II/IIe doesnot have a flashPC connectorto usewith
studio lights and other manual flash units, but you canusea generichot shoeto
PCadapter. Nikon’s AS-15is a goodquality one,but therearelower costversionsas
well. With a manualor studioflashyou will needa flashmeterto getconsistentflash
exposure.Publishedguidenumberscan’t alwaysbetrusted.

TheElanII/IIe canalsouseauto flash units like thevenerableVivitar 283/285or
Sunpak383. This is a way to geta morepowerful flashwithout breakingthebankto
do it. Thereareseveral big limitations however. The meteris in theflashunit andit
will not take into accountthe lens’s field of view. This cangive inaccurateexposures.
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You will alsohave morethingsto seton the flash(ISO, aperture,zoom)andon the
camerayou will have to manuallysetthelensapertureto whattheflashsays,andyou
will have to make surethat your shutterdoesn’t exceed1/125second.Still, with all
that,autoflashis a bargainif powerandversatilityarethemainconsiderations.But if
speed& easeof usearea priority getanEX seriesSpeedlite.

Themostimportantconsiderationwith non-dedicatedflashunits is thesyncvolt-
age. Youmusttestthiswith agoodvolt meter(at least20,000ohmspervolt). With the
flashchargedup& readyto fire, lay oneleadacrossthecontactat thesideof theflash
foot andtheotheron thecenterpin. Canonsaysit hasto be6 volts or less,although
up to 10 volts is probablycloseenough.Someflashunits like theoldermodelsof the
Vivitar 283have morethana 200volt synctrigger. Thesecanfry your camerain one
pop,andaccumulateduseof evena 20volt synccoulddamageyourcamera.

ThemostcompleteinformationaboutCanonflashtechnology, meteringandtheory
canbefoundat: http://teladesign.com/photo/eos-flash/

6 Lenses

6.1 EF Mount Lenses

All lensesthat aredesignedfor EOScamerashave an EF mount on them. They all
shouldwork with the Elan II/IIe. Someolder third party lensesareknown to cause
thecamerato temporarilylock up dueto anincompatibilityproblemthat is discussed
below. All CanonEF mountlenseswill work fine. The bettergradeof CanonUSM
lenses(28-105USM, etc.) usea ring type AF motor that allows Full Time Manual
(FTM) focusingwithout selectingMF on the lensswitch. FTM allows you to auto
focusandthenquickly touchup your focusmanually. Usedwith customfunction#4
to move the AF start to the AE Lock button, theselenseswill changethe way you
take pictures.Or at leasttheway you focus. Beforeyou buy oneof Canon’s cheaper
lensestry oneof thebetterversions.BewarnedthatcheaperUSM lenses(28-90USM,
75-300USM) will notallow FTM.

In my opinionthereareno goodreasonsto buy a cheapthird party lenswith any
CanonEOScamera. Thereare too many incompatibility problemsand they areno
betterthanCanonlensesof equalprice. However therearequite a numberof better
third party lensesthatcansave you money over Canon’s goodbut pricey selectionof
betterlenses.Keepin mind thatyougetwhatyoupayfor. At leastsometimesyoudo.

6.2 Other Lenses

In additionyou canuseany T mount lenswith a T mountadapterring. T mountsare
frequentlyusedfor cheapmirror lensesthathave nearlyworthlessimagequality. But
theT-Mount is alsousedfor macrobellows, attachingthecamerato a microscopeor
telescopeaswell assomeworthwhileolderlenses.

Youcanalsouseany M42 screw mount lenswith a M42 to Screw mountadapter.
Verydecent,low costfisheye lensesareoftenfoundin M42 mount.Theselenseswere
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designedfor cameraslike theearlyPentaxSpotmatics.Someof the lenseswerevery
goodandcanbefoundcheap.

Therearealsoadaptersmadeto fit olderCanonmanualfocuslenses,but thesewill
eithernotallow infinity focusor will increasethefocal lengthof your lenswith asmall
teleconverterbuilt in. They arenot reallyworththepriceor limitationsunlessyouhave
averyspecialold Canonlensto usewith yourEOScamera.

Therearealsoadaptersmadeto fit theEFmountcamerato Nikon,TamronAdaptall
andotherlenses.Thedownsidesto usingany of theseadaptedlensesis that they can
bemanualfocusedonly andthey will have to bemeteredin thestopdown mode.That
is, they will not have anautoaperture,someteringwill bedonein M, Av or P mode,
with a slightly darkenedviewfinder. So focusfirst. TheLCD andviewfinderdisplay
will show the apertureas"00" but you set the apertureon the lensbarrelwith these
anyway.

7 Optional Equipment

7.1 Battery Packs/ Grips

The BP-50Vertical Grip is available for the Elan II/IIe. It is alsoa batterypackas
it takeseitherfour AA batteriesor the 2CR-5that the cameranormally uses.It also
hasanadditionalshutterbutton to usein theverticalpositionanda switch to disable
it. It’ s quitehandyandI usuallyleave mineon unlessI’m trying to reducethesizeof
my photoequipment.Oneproblemwith theverticalgrip is thatit displacesthetripod
mountfrom directlyunderthelensaxisto apositionjustoveraninch to theright side.
It alsowouldbemoreusefulto addaMain Dial, AE Lock buttonandAF pointselector
button.But at leastthis leavesanupgradepathfor futurecameras.

TheBP-5B is anexternalbatterypackthat is usedwith theverticalgrip. It hasa
dummy2CR-5batteryattachedto a coiledwire, andat theotherendis a batterypack
for 4 D cells. Youcankeepthebatterieswarmin yourcoat& still take picturesin sub
zerotemperatures.TheBP-5Bis thesameasaBP-5 (for theEOS5/A2/A2e)but adds
a topplatefor theBP-50thathasaholefor thepowercordto go through.Youcanuse
theslightly cheaperBP-5andmodify thetopplateyourselfif youwant.

7.2 Remotes

TheRC-1 Infra Red Remoteis alsoavailableandwill trip theshutterfrom up to 15
feet in front of thecamera.You canalsouseit to trip a tripod mountedcamerafrom
directlyoverheadif youarecloseenough,soit canbeusedfor macroandlonglensuse
aswell. With customfunction#5setto "1" andtheshuttersetto bulb, aquickpressof
theRC-1will raisethemirror, wait two seconds,thenopentheshutterandhold it open
until youpresstheRC-1’sbuttonagain.

The RS-60E3Cord Remote is short,but convenientfor tripod use. It plugsinto
thesmallconnectorat thelower right sideof thecamera.It usesasmallmini-plugand
somestereoaudioextensioncordscanbeusedwith it to extendits range.It hasa two
positionswitch just like thecamerashutterbutton. Half a pressto activateAF anda
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full pressto fire theshutter. It alsohasaswitchlock to keepthelensopenin bulb mode
withouthaving to hold thebutton.

7.3 Viewfinder Options

Dioptric Corr ective LensesED areavailable to correctvision problems. The Elan
II/IIe has19.5mmof eye relief. Normally peoplewith glassesor contactshave no
problemwith theviewfinderof theElan II/IIe but glasseswearersmayhave to move
their eye aroundsometo seeall of the imageor thedatadisplayat thebottomof the
screen.For this andotherreasonssomepeoplepreferto take their glassesoff while
shooting. For thesepeopleand othersthat have a hard time seeingthe viewfinder
imagesharplyCanonmakesDioptric CorrectiveLenses(DC lenses)for theElanII/IIe.
Theviewfinderhasa-1 built in makingtheimageappearabout1 meteraway. TheDC
lensesaremarkedto takethisinto accountsoa0 DC lensis actuallya+1 to compensate
for thebuilt in -1. If yournormaldistanceprescriptionis -4, buy theCanon-4 DC lens.
But you maywantto try themoutbeforeyoubuy.

The Eyecup Ec II is standardbut the optional larger EyecupEd-E can also be
used.Theviewfinderattachments,Angle Finder B and Magnifier S canbeusedbut
youhaveto usetheAdapter Ed to mountthemto thelargerthannormalviewfinderof
theElanII/IIe.

7.4 Off CameraShoeCord 2

The Off Camera ShoeCord 2 (OCSC2)is usedto get an externalSpeedliteflash
mountedoff thecamera’shotshoe.It providesabout2 feetof easyextensionandif you
pull on thecoiledwire you canstretchit to about3 feet. Canonrecommendsagainst
it, but you canextendthis by addingtwo OCSC2’s together, end-to-end.Checkthis
out thoroughlybeforeyou needto make sureyou don’t have any impedanceinduced
exposureerrors.

8 Known Problems

8.1 Battery Compartment

Not all 2CR-5’s areexactly the samedimensions.Somearejust a weebit shortand
thiscancauseproblemswith theElanII/IIe. Theusualproblemis thecamerawill lock
upwhenyou take a pictureandthebatteryindicatorin theLCD will blink. (Thereare
otherproblemsthat canalsocausethis samesymptomhowever.) This canbe easily
remediedby puttinga smallpieceof cardboardbetweenthebottomof thebatteryand
thebatterydoor. Thiswill pressthebatteryfartherinto it compartment,insuringbetter
contact.You canalsoreachinto thebatterycompartmentwith a smallhookandraise
thebatterycontactsasthey seemto benddown too far with use.For what it’s worth,
Sanyo 2CR-5arereportedto work bestwith theElanII/IIe.

Thebattery door hinge is just a thin pieceof plasticthatbendswhenyouopenit.
With a lot of useor abusethis canfail. CanonUSA soldme onefor cheapalthough
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the repairprocesswasa bit tricky. Fortunatelythis hasn’t provento be asfrequenta
problemasmany peopleexpectedthatit wouldbe.

8.2 Lens Incompatability

Otherthanproblemswith thebatterycompartment,themostfrequentlyreportedtrou-
bleseemsto beanincompatibilitywith somethird partylenses.They sometimescause
thecamerato lock upwith thebatteryindicatorflashingin theLCD. Somelenseswill
simplynotwork atall with theElanII/IIe andotherswill lock uponly if youuseit with
themotordrivesetoncontinuous.Somethird partylenseswill notcausethissymptom
but theaperturewill notwork or it will displaysomeothermalady.

9 Specifications

TheEOSElanII/IIe is a greatcamerawith plentyof featuresfor theenthusiast.It has
provento be reliableandeasyto use. It hasbeenupgradedto theEOS30/Elan7/7e
which hasa few moreAF point, a bit fasteroperationanda few otherimprovements,
but theElanII/IIe isn’t farbehind.

Viewfindercoverage: 90%verticaland92%horizontalwith 19.5mmof eye relief
Meteringsystem:6 zoneevaluative,9.5%partialandcenterweighted
Meteringrange: EV1 to EV 20with 50mmf/1.4 lensand100ISOfilm
Film Speedrange: ISO 6 to ISO 6400,or ISO 25to ISO5000with DX coding
AF workingrange: EV 0 to EV18 with ISO 100film
AF assistbeam: Near infrared,up to 21 feet for centerAF point and13 feet for

sideAF points
Shutter:Electronicallytimed,30secondsto 1/4000second,topflashsyncat1/125

sec.
Film advance:2.5framespersecondmax.
Built in flash:GN of 42 feetwith ISO100film, coveragefor 28mlens
Dimensions& weight: 152.5mm(W) x 104.4mm(H) x 71mm(D), 590grams
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